
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 16-16040

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: One Time Purchase of Various Automotive Shop Equipment

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 2, 2016
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 1 ea. UNIT    *  

On Vehicle Brake Lathe with standard and speciality adapters Pro-Cut PRICE No Bid 10,299.98 13,075.00 9,245.00 10,265.00

1. International Model PMF9.2 or SAWS approved equal TOTAL  10,299.98 13,075.00 9,245.00 10,265.00

1 ea. UNIT     *

R-134A Refrigerant Recovery, Recycling and Recharging Machine for PRICE 3,725.00 3,749.00 5,160.00 3,623.00 3,404.00

2. Hybrid and Non-Hybrid Vehicles Robinair Model 34788NI-H or SAWS approved equal TOTAL 3,725.00 3,749.00 5,160.00 3,623.00 3,404.00

1 ea. UNIT    *  

1,000 lbs (1/2) ton Telescopic Transmissiion Jack Sunnex Tools Model 7793B or PRICE 795.00 639.99 910.00 428.00 589.89

3. SAWS approved equivalent TOTAL 795.00 639.99 910.00 428.00 589.89

 UNIT   *  Item Not

1 ea. PRICE No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 No Bid Submitted

4. Manual Solvent Parts Washer Safety Kleen Model 30 or SAWS approved equal TOTAL   1,000.00  for Approval

 UNIT  *    

2 ea. PRICE No Bid 299.99 860.00 No Bid 499.89

5. Professional Series Fleet Battery Charger Napa, Model NBC 855000 or SAWS approved equal TOTAL  599.98 1,720.00  999.78

2 ea. UNIT *

Portable Battery Jump Starter Clore Autmotive, Model ES1224 Portable Battery Jump PRICE 599.00 469.99 855.00 416.00 598.75

6. Starter or SAWS approved equal TOTAL 1,198.00 939.98 1,710.00 832.00 1,197.50

Net 2% 1/4% Net Net

 Terms 30 days 10 days 10 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Schedule     

 

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 Accuturn MAHA USA Demandstar

ARI-hetra Myers Tire Supply SAWS Website

Bendpak, Inc. Northstar Equipment

Carl Turner Equipment Petroleum Solutions

Eagle Equipment SA Hunter

Genuine Parts Co. Sankey Equipment Co.

Greg Smith Equipment Steambrite

Jacobs Equipment Technology International Inc.

Jam Distributing Techstar
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